COMMON COUNCIL—APRIL

Council Chamber, Ann Arbor Mich,,
April 3, 1922,
Regular Session
There not being a quorum pres-
ent on account of election, Counci
adjourned to meet April 6, 1922,
at 7:30 o’clock p. m,
ISAAC G. REYNOLDS,
City Clerlk

Council Chamber, Ann Arbor Mich.,

April 6, 1922,

Adjourned Regular Session

Meeting called to order by City
Clerk anl Ald. Sugden chosen to
p-ecide pro tem.

Presen : Ald. Slauson, Sugden,
Ehn’s, Haarer, Lucas Henderson.
Donnelly, Groves, Spathelf, Moore,

MacGregor, White, Harri 13.
Absent: Ald. Lutz, Pres. Reich-
ert—2.
M'nutes of Marzh 20, 1922, ap-
p:oved.

Ann Arbor, Mich., April 6, 1922.
Hon. Geo. E. Lewis. May r, and the

Honorab'e, the Common counci ,

Ann Arbor, Mich.

Dear Sir: It is with regret that
I am handing you my resignation
as Pres dent ol ~he common coun-
cil of the City of Ann A:b»rv, but
lusiness reasons make th's course
imperative. My association with
you and all of the City Officials ha:
l ecn exceed ncoly pleasant. Tace co-
01)er‘ation anl support that I have
recelved from -~he governing Lody
of your City over which I was
chosen to preside has been very
grat' fying to me. I1f I have been
of some sma’ll service to the City
during the five years that I have
kLecen a member of the Council,.I
saall be well repaid for the time
spent.

Respectfully,
R. E. REICHERT.

Moved by A'd. Donnelly, that
res‘’ena‘ion be accepted.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas
—Ald. Slauson, Sugden, Ehnis,
Haarer, Lucas, Henderson, Don-
nelly, Groves, Spathelf, Moore,
MacGregor, White, Norris— 13.
Nays—none.

From Board of Public Works

Moved by Mr. Atwe 1, that Board
reque-ts permission of Council to
replace and purchase necessary re-
ceptacles for waste paper on streets
and public places.

(Council action.)

Moved by Ald. Lucas, that re-
quest of Board be granted.
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Adopted by following vote: Yeas
—Ald. Slauson, Sugden, Ehnis,
Haarer, Lucas, Henderson, Dunnel-
'y, Groves, Spathelf, Moore, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norris—13. Nays
none.

(From Board.)

City Engineer pre-ented plans,
specifications and prelim nary es-
timates for Shadfrrd Road Sani-
tary sewer, for Washington Heights
sanitary sewer and Washington
Heights outlet sanitary sewer, a'so
for storm water sewer on Golden,
Woodlawn, Packard, Wells and
Forest Ave. in two rectinons.

Moved Ly Mr. Reule, that plans
specificat’ons and estmates be ap-
proved and referred to Council.

Referred to Sewer Committee.

(Fr~m Board.)

City Engineer bpresented Asses-
so:s’ Plats, Nos. 6, 7, &, 9, 10 11.

Moved by Mr. Atwell, that pla's
be approved anl referred t» Coui -
cil.

((Council action.)

Moved by Ald. White, th-t As-
ses ors’ Plats Nos. 6, 7, 8, 9 10 and
11 be approved.

Adopted hy following vote; Yeas

—Ald. Slauson, Sugden, Ehnis,
Haarer, Lucas, Henderson, Donnel-
ly Groves, Spathelf, Moore, Mac-
gregor, White, Norris—13. Nays—
ncne.

(From Board.)

Moved by Mr. Rehberg, that

Board requests Council for permis-
sion to remove hi‘ching posts in
the business district on Main street.

(Counc!l action.)

Moved by Ald. Slauson, that re-
quest of Board be concurred in.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas
—Ald S auson, Sugden, Ehnis,
Haarer, Lucas, Henderron, Donnel-
ly, Groves Spathelf, Moore, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norris—13. Nays—
none.

(From Board.)

City Engineer presented tabula-
tion of bids for construction of
concrete pavement on Cross St
from Packard to Division Sts., as

follows: Ann Arbor Asphalt Con-
struction Co., $2,826.00; DButler
Construction Co., $3,205.50; R. J.

Powelson & Co., $2,540.00; Wm. H.
Ryan. $3.290.50; Gustin & Co., $2,-
286.00. Moved by Mr. Cole, that
all bids be rejected and Board re-
quests permission of Council to
construct said pavement on Cross
St.
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Lo Sheet Asphalt | .

Exhibit A. Washed Screened ‘v":

' f Ags. Agg.

A. A. Asphalt Con. Co., A. A. Mich.: i
N, Biate BLroBl e . b wity s ot $29.196.52 $27,329.02 30|
Packard SEreet: vs . .s voimms e s 15.702.12 1457612 '3
BEITE IR0 o vy s sttt e 35 831.16  33.135.91|  n

$80.729.80  $75 040.05| g75!

Butler Const. Co., Waukesha, Wis.:

N. Blate: Btreot . ars «vnssin . $27.720 74 No bid $a7
HIL S ERaet o e 5% v pen . o e 34 969.07 No bid 23
Packard Bhrealt oo vicavicisan 15,211.58 No bid $14

$77.901.39 §74

R. J. Powelson & Co. Detroit, Mich. ey
N. Btate Straet it s i veiay $28.065.00 $27.686.50 $27.1
EA LT S BB et o ory swrniit s e s i 35 965.08 35 426.03 33,
Packard SBtreely i we s voas 15 766.99 15 541.59 14, |

$79 797.07 $78,654.12 $75 1

Wm. J. Clancy, Ann Arbor, Mich.: 5
N, State Blreal e te i iin e s No bid N
Hill Sirael it e ke No bid Nev
Packard Streetifes o S ot ih No bid washe

price

Municipal Con. & Sup.Co. Gary, Ind.

N. State Htveel Ti, st wn - $31 964.98 No bid $31,
EAHSEreet ©ocn e lion e ah iyl 35,356.75 No hid 384
Packard Strael -0 0. o aviaes 15,362.53 Nc bid 14,

$82 684.26 $79.,

Wm. H. Ryan, Jackson, Mich.:

N. State S . & S iifet v A s No bid No bid y
Hill BEPaRt s fus gt e s o i aw S : - No bid No hid B
Packard Street ..¢ceeeoesiene

Gustin & Co., Detroit, Mich.: Barber Asphalt 4
N. State Btreet o7, sima v s s Smine $29,136.60 $28.314.90 $27,41
FHIL BRrent . . ... vemmail on 20 36,405.35 35003.82| 320
Packard Stresl o0 v. cuveonnns 16,018.05 15,432.20 14,4]

$81.560.00  $78,750.92 | §T4.6

Natural Asphalt J

N. Btafe BLPeeb, . .wst e ons wesss $29,580.40  $28,758.70 $28.3l!
ETiH St e « crsieda s an 5o ok 37,483.45 36.081.92 33,81
Packard Street +u.eeveee.eoas 16,468.85 15 882.81 14,81
p———

$83,532.70  $80,723.43| 876,56

I
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» Concrete Brick & Curb & Gutter Brick & Cone. Curb
Screened ‘Washed Screened Washed Screened
Agsg. AgE. Agsg. Agg. Agg.
$26 441.42 $85,113.32 $33 245.82 $36,672.16 $34,670.91
13,673.52 21.844.60 20,717.60
30,979.71 50,.170.84 47,475.59
$71,094.65 $107.128.76 $101 439.01
No bid $32 493.50 No bid $33,965.25 No bid
No bid No bid . No bid
No bid No bid No bid
$26,803.90 $32,387.20 $32,013.70 $33,746.50 $33,354.25
33.269.83 46 417.98 45,878.93
14 639.99 20 341.19 20 115.79
' $74 713.12 $99.146 37 $98 008.42
Meatronolitan Townsend Metropolitan Townsend
332 .872.30 $34.171.10 $35,088.10 $35,408.30
eened and 48 640.52 49,071.76
sgate same 21.263 .78 21,444.08
$103.776.58 $104 686.94
No bid $42 516.98 No bid $44,656.49 No bid
No bid 60 991.17 No bid
No bid 26.172.65 No bid
$129.680.80
i Washed Metro. Agg. Town.
; No hid $34.721.70 $ 35.020.50 $35,812.55 $36 132.75
: No hid 49 584.87 50,016.11
21,725.91 21 906.23
$106.032.48 $106 942.84
;Asphalt ;
. $26,761.60 $34.058.90 $33,237.20 $34,949.55 $34,069.00
g 31 230.47 48,325.40 46,923.87
¢ 13,854.21 21,165.05 20,579.00
©8$71,846.28 |  $103,549.35 $100 740.07
“Asphalt
. $27,205.40
32,308.57
i 14 304.96
7873 818.93

-
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(Council action.)

Moved by Ald. MacGregor, that
action of Board in rejecting bids for
Cross St. pavemen: be concurred
in and the Board be authorized to
construct said pavement.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas
—A'd. Slauson, Sugden, Ehn's,
Haarer, Lucas, Henderson, Donnel-
ly, Grove~, Spathelf, Moore Mac-
Gregor, White, Norris—13, Nays—
none.

(From Board.)

By Mr. Atwell: Resolved, tha‘
the Board of Public Works recom-
mends to the Common Council the
use of sheet asphalt for the wear-
ing surface for Hill St., Packard
St., and State St. from Huron St.
to Kingsley St. and brick wearing
crurface on State St. from Kingsley
to Fuller St. That the aggregates for
the base course for these street-
be obtained from screen.ng local
grave’.

(Council action.)

Moved by Ald. Slauson, that rec-
ommendation of Board be con-
curred in.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas
—Ald. Slauson, Sugden, Ehnis
Haarer, Liucas, Henderson, Donnel-
ly, Groves. Spathelf, Moore, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norrs—13. Nays—
none.

(From Board.)

City Engineer presented follow-
ing tabulation of bids for pave-
ments on N. State St. from Huron
St. to Fuller St., Packard St. from
Granger Ave. to city limits and Hill
St. from Wa-htenaw Ave. to Pack-
ard St.

(See Ex. A.)

Moved by Mr. FRehberg, that
Board recommends to Council the
awarding of contracts to Ann Ar-
bor Asphalt Cons‘ruction Company
for construction of pavements on
N. State St., Packard St. and Hill
St. with material as specified in
resolution presented by Mr. Atwell,
and adopted by th's Board.

(Council action.)

Moved by Ald. Norris, that rec-
ommendation of Board be con-
curred in,

Adopted by following vote: Yeas
—Ald. Slauson, Sugden, Ehnis,
Haarer, Lucas, Henderson, Donnel-
ly, Groves, Spathe'f Moore, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norric—-3. Nays—
none.

(From Board.)
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Moved by Mr. Hutzel, that Board
requests Council not to accep: pe-
titiecn for applying calcium chloride
or road ol after May 15, 1922,

(C uncil action.)

Moved by Ald. MacGregor, that
request of Board be granted and
City Clerk puklish notice,

Adopted by fol'owing vote: Yeas
—Ald. Slauson. Sugden, Ehnis
Haarer. Lucas, Iienderson Donnel-
ly, Groves, Spa‘he f, Moo:e, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norris—13, Nays—
none.

(From Board.)

Moved by Mr. Scott, that Board
requests permission of Council to
purchase team of horse and pen-
sion present city team on account
of old age.

(Council act'on.)

Moved by Ald. Donnelly, that re-
quest of Board e gran ed.

Adopted by fo owing vote: Yeas
—Ald. Slauson, Sugden, Ehnis,
Haarer, Lucas. Henderson, Donnel-
ly, Groves, Spathe’f, Moore, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norris—13. Nays—
none.

Ald. MacGregor informed Coun-
cil that Mr. M. E. Easterly had
faithful'y served the city as jani-
tor for over 27 years, and stated
that he -hould receive a pension
which matter was referrcd to Fin-
ance Committee.

Commun cations relative to pro-
posed pavement on ‘Washtenaw
Ave., were received as follows:

From Frank F. Rogers, State
Highway Comm‘ssioner, withdraw-
ing the state’s offer to participa‘e in
the construction of said pavement
on account of Washtenaw County
owing state on construction of Fed-
eral Aid No. 35:

From Frank F. Rogers acknowl-
edging rece'pt of certified copy of
Council proceedings of March 20,
1922;

From Shirley W. Smith, Secre-
tary of TUniver-ity of Michigan,
transmitting cony of resolutions
adopted by the Regents of the
University of Michigan on March
31, 1922, expressing their conviction
that the rout‘ng of all through
traffic coming into Ann Arbor over
streets leading directly past the
campus will cause such a conges-
tion of traffic as will resu't In seri-
ous danger and great delays, and
will be greatly detrimental to the
best interests of the University;
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From Waldo M. Abbot, stating if
twenty foot strip on Washtenaw
Ave. is not pa'd by national state
and county governments, the peti-
tion for paving said street will not
be binding upon the signers, as it
wa~ signed with that understand-
ing;

From E. L. Adams, Alfred H.
Lloyd and M. P. Til ey requesting
‘hat the'r names be stricken from
petition;

From Mack & Co. and 128 other
Lusiness firms on Main anl Pack-
ard Sts., asking Council to recon-
sider action taken March 24U, ap-
proving Washtenaw Ave, as route
for State Trunk Line 17.

Communications ordered on file.

H. E. Riggs and .ohn F. Shep-
ard addressed Counc.l relative to
route for propo ed State Tuunk

I. ' ne No. 17.
Ald. MacGregor moved to re-
consider vote taken at last meet-

ing, relative to adoption of Street
Comm‘ttee report recommending to
the State Highway Commission that
State Trunk Line No. 17 come into
the City of Ann Arbor on Washte-
naw Ave., as or.ginaily planned.

Recons dered by following vote:
Yeas—Ald. S’auson, Sugden, Ehnis,
Haarer, Lucas, Henderson Donnel-
'y, Groves, Spathe f, Mcore, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norris—13. Nays—
noane,

On motion of Ald. Norr's, Street
Committee report was referred
back to Stree. Cocmmittee.

Moved by Ald. White, that re-
quest~ of E. I. Adams, Alfred H.
Lloyd and M. P. Til ey, to withdraw
the:r names from petizion for pave-
ment on Washtenaw Ave. be grant-
ed.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas
—Ald. lauson, Sugden, Ehnis
Haarer, Lucas, Henderson, Donnel-
ly, Groves, Spathelf, Moore, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norris—13. Nays—
none.

Commun.cation from Ann Arbor
Workingmen Association, request-
ing that a minimum wage be stip-
ula‘ed for all public work and that
resident workmen be given work in
preference to outside labor re-
ceived and referred to various
boards employing labor.

Commun.cation from the Com-
munity Federation requesting u-e
of Fourth Ave. from Huron to
Catherine Sts., and- Ann St. from

-and of Christian Bauer et al.
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Main St. to Fifth Ave., from May
15th to Nov. 15th, for a curb mar-
ket received and referred to Board
of Public Works on motion of Ald.
Henderson.

Curh and Gutter Petitions

On 8. Division St. from Cross St.
to Madison St.

On Walnut St. from Geddes Ave.
to S. University Ave.

On Oxford Road from H'll St. to
Washtenaw Ave.

On Hill St. from Packard St. to
Main St.

Received and referred to Street
Committee.

Petition of Geo. H., Fischer et al.
for ranitary sewer on Henry St.
from Packard St. to Golden Ave.
and on Westminster Place, Fern-
da}(- Flace and Montelair P ace re-
ceived and referred to Sewer Com-
mittee.

Petition of James H. Freeman tn
connec’ h's property at 1035 Berk-
shire Road with city sewer.
ceived and referred to Sewer (o .-
mittee,

Petitions of M‘ke Pagan et al.
for water main on Ma‘den Lane
for
water main on Day St. received and
referred to Water Comm ttee and
Water Commission.

Petition ¢f M. C. Beard et al. for
legislation to »revent erection of
and for removal of hillbnhards in
residence districts, received and re-
ferred to Ordinance Comm:ttee.

Oiling Petition

Of Robert Neelands et al. on For-

est Ave. from Cambridge Road to

T .

Minerva Road received and re-
ferred to City Engineer.
COMMITTEE REPORTS
F nance Committiee
Contingent Fund

Geo. E. Lew’s, salary....$} 41.66
I. G. Reynolds, ralary . 208.33
Ross Granger, sa'ary . 208.33
Herbert W, Crippen, sal.. 208.33
Alfred J. Paul, salary ... 208.33
Geo. H. Sandcenburgh, sal. 250.00
Roscoe O. Bon!steel, sal. 166.66
H. R. Scovill, salary 166.66
John A. Wessinger, salary 150.00
C. F. Hartman, salary ... 130 00
Douglas Bycraft, salary.. 125.00
Philip O’Hara, salary.... 125 00
Marcia M. Minnis, salary. 100.00
Charles Stoll, salary .... 100.00
Henrictta Disderide, sal.. 90.00
M. E. Easterly, salary 90.00
Jessie Crippen. salary 83.33
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Florence Hallen, salary 83.23
Ned R. Smith, salary ... 75.00
Frank Marz, salary one-

ha!'f month .......... 74.64
Edwin Ganzhorn, salary. 50,00
Dorothy Wr ght, calary.. 24.00
Cont ' ngent Fund total

galaries Liavevevs v $2,758.60

F.re Fund

Chas. Andrews, salary...$ 9516
Eugene Williams, salary. 81.48
Ralph Edwards, salary.. 81.48
Henry McLarcn, salary.. 77.65
Jacob Gwinner, sa.ary... 77.65
Frank Markey, calary... 74.64
Herman Kruse, salary... 74.64
Mat, Heininger, salary... 74.64
Floyd Naylor, salary.... 74.64
Earl Arnold, calary 74 64
Fred Nordman, salary .. 74.64
Benj. Zahn, salary ...... 74.64
Henry Nevroth, salary 74.64
Raymond Gillespie, salary 74 64
Ross Moore, salary ..... 74.64
Arthur Clark, salary 67.96
Clyde (Carpenter, saiary.. 67.96
Chas. Carroll, salary..... 42.61

F.re Fund total salaries
on:-half month March.$1,338 35

Police Fund

Thos. O Briem, salary....$ 95.16
H. J. McNally, salary.... 79.16
W. J. Apr.1l salary ..... 74.64
Ed. Blumhardt, salary... 74.64
Frank Keihl, salary..... 74 64
Mariend Howard, salary. 74.64
Chas. Splitt, sa’ary...... 74.64
Joseph Gast, salary 74.64
Geo, Randel, salary ..... 74.64
Louis Fohey, salary ..... 74.64
Jacob Andres, salary . 74.64
Chas, Kapp. salary ..... 69.71
John Osborn, salary 67.96

Police Fund total salaries
one half month March.$ 983 75
Poor Fund
John H. Shadford, salary.$
Cemetery Fund
Herman Zulz, salary..... $
Park Fund
E. A. Gallup, salary ....$ 208.33
Henrietta Disderide, sal.. 10.00

50.00

95.00

Park Fund total salaries.$ 218.33
Water Works Fund
Geo. S. Vamdawarker, sal.$ 208.33

Leslie Bush, salary...... 192.50
Dr. H L Emerson, csalary .. 50.00
E. Cornell, salary ...... 10.00
Geo, Mann, salary ...... 20.00
John Lindenschmitt, sal.. 20.00
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Wirt Cornwell, salary.... 20 00
Total monthly sa’aries...$ 520.83
Harry W.llsher, salary...$§ 64.62
Emanuel Sodt, salary 77.55
Fred Linde, salary ...... 68.75
Robt. Rowe, salary ..... 51.70
Robt. Young, salary 48.47
A. E, Hawk:s, salary .... 55 00
Cliff Shetterly, calary.... 77.55
Louise Malloy, sa'ary 55.00
R.ussell Pryce, sa.ary 55.00
William Groves, ca.ary.. 50.00
Total semi-monthly sal-

ATIEN ;aimam g inse $ 603.64
Water Works Fund total

SEIATIES oo aeumws v mEs s $1,124.47

Cont ngent Fund
Municipal Garage
Standard Oil Co., sup ...$ 10550

The Lacey Co.. supplies.. 6.64
W. E. A'exande:. :erv.ccs 19.50
Henry S. Platt, r »Dairs .. 22.87

Mun'c'pal Garage total..$ 154.51
Engineer Department

R H. Barkell, services...$ 4.00
W. H. Fe.dkamp, services 2.00
Fred Hanselman, services 1.75
H. F. Ma'n, scervices..... 5.50
James Ma<on, sevvic s 3.75
V. W. M:Adam, serv.ces . 78 00
Wm. Niethamer, cervices 2.00
Total Engineer Dept. ....$§ 97.00
H. J. Abbott P. M., post .§ 22 88
The Detroit Ed.son Co,,

city ha'l ete ........ 36.20
Fred T. McOmber csurety

bond .....c..iiiia.. - 3.50
Besch & Gutekunst, col-

lecting garbage ....... 1,273.33
FEugene D._ctzgen Co, sup. 21.15 °
Doubledoy Hunt Dolan

COMPANY + v v e v ne e e 27.80
Maurice Fraser Co., sup 2.55
Frederick Post Co.. sup.. 8.00
Calkins-Fletcher Drug Co.

SUDDPHES «ww e s wws 55 9.75
Sid W. M llard, printing.. 14950
The Ann Arbor Press, ptsg. 18.50
The Atheng Press, ptg.. .. 28.00
Davis & Oh’inger, ptg.... 17.25
Car] Splitt, burial an.mals 650
R. A. Steward repa’rs... 132
E. A. Wines and S. Ben-

ham, painting 4th ward

polling place ......... 113.55
TIda M. Reynolds, services 8.00
Total supplies ete. ...... $1,747.78
Contingent Fund total in-

cluding salaries ...... $4 757.89
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Fire Fund

The Detroit Edison Co.,

Hebt scimsmmnssmngss $ 8.73
Eaton-Clark Co., supplies 12.00
Rain bow Color & Chem-

ical Co.. supplies ...... 4.78
The Superior Seal &

Stamp Co., supplies 3.50
Dean & Co  Ltd . supplics 8.25
The Mayer-Scha rer Co.,

supplies ... . . ... 2.05
Vernon J. McCrumb, sup. 21.00
Chas. 8. Mil.en suppl.es. 23.40
Monson Pattern & Maec-

h ne Works, supplies.. 2.10
Ann Arbor Garage, r¢p .. .51
Jacch QGwinner, freight

otz T L L T 2.43
Total supplies ete. . ..... $ 88.75
F.re Fund total including

salaries . wsaesieews e ws $1.,427.10

Police Fund
The Western Un on Te'e-

graph Co., telegram...$ 1.46
Mich. Stat: Tel. Co.. tolls 2156
Electrical & Spec'alty

Supply Co, supplies... 12.50
Enterprise Pa nt Mfg.

Co., supplies ......... 8.00
C. D. Reese, supp.ies . 43 96
The Mayer-Scharer Co,

supplies ool 2.70
Muehlig & Schmid. sup... 9.00
S hmacher Hardware

Co, supplis ......... 10.50
Clyde C. Kerr & Sons,

pr.ntng ... ... ... .. 9.00
Weissinger S.rn  Works,

Irttering . ............ 250
Cty Taxi & Baggage Line

taxi servee L.l 2.50
Thos, O'Brien, exp. pd... .92
Total supplies, etc, ..... $ 105.19
Pglice Fund totak includ-

‘ng salaries .....is0005 $1,088.94

Poor Fund
Mrs, Evan Ecsery, Treas.

Olda Lad.es’ Hom<¢ ....% 12 00
D, C. Haas, supplies..... 12.83
Kyer & Whitker supplies 15.16
Walker's Grocery, sup.... 30.00
Edna Formhals, exp. .... 5.70
Varsity Laundry. laundry 12.15
Ann Arbor Taxicabh &

Transfer (Co., services. 12.00
Total supplies, ete, ...... $ 99.84
Poor Fund total inctuding

salary ............... $§ 149.84

291
Water Fund
Water Works eDpt.,, gen-
eral services ......... $2,376.62
Water Works Fund
Crane Co., supplies ..... $ 54.74
John J, Sauer, supplies .. 8.58
Ann Arbor Foundry Co,
supplies ............. 39.30
H. Channon Co., suppl.es 11.40
Bmgham & Taylor, sup... 122.03
Schumacher Hdw. Co.,
cupplies ... 0oL, 210
John Volz & Son, sup.... 3.35
Mich., Central Railroad
Co.,, freght .......... 15.11
American Exp. Co., exp.. 6.54
G. S. W.ll ams, services. . 30.00
City Treasurer, renewal
ahd replacement exp... 1500.00
Water Works De¢pt., exp.. 9.75
Total cuppl.es ete, ...... $1,802.90
L. Gerrick, labor ....... $ 30.00
J. Andres, labor ....... 12.00
A. Gerst'er, labor ....... 28.0)
I’ Wa.sh, labor ........ 31.00
Tota; labor ............ $ 1J..00
Water Works Fund total
including salaries ..... 3,028.37
Park Fung
Fred Biggs, labor ....... $ 6.00
W.ifred Hopper, labor .. 5.40
Henry Francicco, labor .. 4.00
Total 1abor e venwsms $ 15.40
The Hardie Mfg. Co., sup. .88
Park Fund total includ:ng
SAlATIES wuwvmwwps s v s $ 234.61
Strect Fund
L. G. Bird, labor ......§ 61.10
John Brokaw, labor ..... 8.00
Wm. Clark. labor ...... 12.00
Wtlliam Hallcn, labor ... 12.60
Emanuel Holzapfel labor 18.00
Carl Janke, labor ....... 16.20
Sam Kalmbach, labor 10.25
Geo. Keller, labor ...... 7.20
Jm L piri, labor ........ 8.40
Fred Malke, labor ...... 16.80
Mike Mareno, labor ..... 8 40
James Mason, labor ..... 33 25
Chas. Paul, labor ....... 32.80
Ed. Roehm, labor ...... 9.60
Adam Schlecht, labor 4.80
Carl Seeger, labor ...... 13.60
Fred Ulrich, labor ...... 16.00
Martin Walsh, labor 11.00
O. Wright, labor ........ 18 15
John Wendland, labor ... 28.00
Ann Arbor Asphalt Con-
struction Co., tractor.. 11.93
Ann Arbor Garagze, tractor 45.09
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Walter Feldkamp, team. 19.50
Fred G, Hanselman, team 29.26
John Herrst, team ...... 56.00
John Millcr, team ...... 3.56
Carl Rehberg, team ..... 46.33
Ja-eob Young, teaim .. is 69 58
TBOEAL" 1AL . - cies o o o e $ 627.39
Elg.n Street Swecepcr Co.,

DD S o i o $ 210.00
Federal Motor Truck Co.,

SHPPLHES o e 0 5 v 3.59
Monson Pattern and Ma-

ch'ne Works, repairs.. 54.32
Michigan Central Rail-

road, frelght .., . ros 3.63
Total supplics, ete ...... $ 271.54
Street Fund total ....... $ 898.93

Bridge Cul. and C, W. Fund

John Brokaw, labor ..... $ 14.00
Wm. Clark, labor ....... 8.40
Clar:-nce EIl ot, labor 5.70
Walt-y Feldkamp, labor. 8.50
Del, F. Hammond, labor . 3.60
Fred Hanselman, labor.. 11.00
Geo Hauser, labor ...... 7.60
Geo. Kel'er, labor ...... 13.60
Geo. MacKay, labor 360
James Mason, labor ..... 8.50
Ehias, Panlrahorss e, e 14.00
Ed. Roehm, labor ...... 14.00
Oscar Scherdt labor 9.50
Adam Schlecht, labor 14.80
Adolf Sch’echt, 1abor 10 80
Edw:in Schlecht, labor 10.80
Car]l Se ger, labor ...... 8.40
Fred Uleich, laboxr . ..:.. 17.50
Martin Walsh, labor 17.50
Bridge Cul. & C. W. Fund

total ‘labor. ..o o e $ 201.80

Street Lighting Fund

William Gerstner, serv...$ 25.00

RECAPITULATION

Contingent . /. ova ey $ 4,757.89
1% o TR I RS s L 1,427.10
Pollce -l i en 1,088.94
001 o iter¥iiisic it RO 149.84
flemieteryr i UEs = e 95.00
Street Lighting ........ 25.00
WY aler. oo it R e 2,376.63
Water Works Tl . 3028.37
B A ad s e T e 234.61
SIRE = RO s 898.93
Bridee Cnl, & G W, .. 201.80
City Funds total ....... $14.284.11

Ann Arbor, Mich ,
Aprl 6, 1922.
To the Finance Comm:ittee of the
Common Counecil,
Gentlemen:
I have gxamined the foregoing
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accounts against the city of Ann
Arbor and I hereby c:rtify that
they are corrcct to the best of my
knowledge,

ISAAC G. REYNCLDS,

C.ty Clerk.

To the Hcnorable the Common
Council,
Gentlemen:

Your Finance comm ttee has re-
vi: wed the foregoing report, War-
rants for salarits were drawn
Aprl 1, 1922, We recommend that
same be approved and that war-
rants be ordered drawn for the
foregoinz accounts.

GEO. LUTZ,

ALBERT D. GROVES,

MARK B. SUGDEN.,
Finance Comm ttee.

Ald. Groves moved the adopt.on
of report, whizh wa~- adopted by
follow.ng vote: Yeas—Ald. S au-
son Sugden, Ehn's, Haarer, Lucas,
Henderson, Donnelly, Groves, Spa-
thelf, Moore, MacGregor, White,
Norris—13. Nays—none.

Sidewaix Commitiee
By Ald. MacGregor:

Resolved, that the Board of Pub-
lic Works be authorized to adver-
tise for bids for construction of
sidewalks, also walks in front of
driveways, alley entrance~ and pri-
vate courts w:.th bumpers on bota
sides, and also walks over area
ways etc., with reinforced con-
Crete.

Adopted by fol'owing vote: Yeas
—Ald. Slauson, Sugden, Ehnis,
Haarer, Lucas, Henderson, Donnel-
ly, Groves, Spathelf, Moore, Mac-
Gregor, White Norris—13. Nays—
none.

Ald. MacGregor called attention
to advisability of amending ordi-
nance relative to construct'on of
s‘dewalks and matter was referred
to Ordinance *Committee.

Sidewalk Grade Resolution
By Ald. MacGregor:

Whereas, in the opinion of the
Council the grade of the sidewalk
on the south side of W. Huron St.
ought to be changed and fixed and
established to the end that suc_h
street may be suitab’e for puble
travel. Therefore,

Resolved, And it is herebytor-
dered. that the grade of the 31(;e--
walk on and along the south side
of W. Huron St. from 350 ft. W. oi
center line of Chapin St. to 550 ft.
W. of center line of Chapin St. be,
and the same it hereby changed,
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fixed and established, so that the
grade of said sidewalk on and along
the street aforesa:d shall be as
follows, that is to say:

Sta. 0 plus 00 equals center line
Chapin St.; Sta. 3 plus 50 equals Pt.
of beg. W. of Chapin St.; Sta. 3 plus
50 equals El. 816.26; Sta. 4 plus 00
equals 819.09; S*a. plus 30 eqmuals
820.80; Sta. plus 40 equals 821.24;
Sta. plus 50 eauals 821.85; Sta.
pus 60 equals 822.32; Sta. plus 70
equals 822.74; Sta. plus 80 equals
823.13; Sta. plus 90 equals 823.47;
Sta. 5 nlus 50 equals 825.40; the
elevation given being ahove the of-
ficial city datum and along the
center line of such walk, and the
grade l'nes to consist of straight
lines between the s2veral points or
stations above stated.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas
—Ald. S auson, Sugden, Ehnis,
Haarer, Loucas Henderson, Donnel-

lv. Groves, Spathelf, Moore, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norris—13. Nays—
none,
Bon: Committce Report
Ton the Honorable, the Common
Council.
Gentlemen:

Your committee on bonds has
had the followihg bonds under con-
sideratinn and respectfully recom-
mends their approval:

(City officia> bond—Isaac G. Rey-
nolds, City Clerk, principal; <he
F*delity & Deposit Co., of Maryland,
sure‘y.

Plumber’~ hond—=Sam. C. An-
dres prine¢ipal; Frederick Heusel
and Samuel S. Hammial, sureties.

Respectfully submitted, Alfred
White Chris. T. Donnelly, Geo. L.
Haarer, Bond Committee.

Ald. White moved the adoption
of report, which was adopted by
following vote: Yeas—Ald. S’au-
son, Sugden, Ehnis, Haarer, Lucas,
Henderson, Donnelly, Groves. Spa-
thelf, Moore, MacGregor, White,
Norris—13. Nays—none.

Special Committee Report
To the Honorable Common Council.

Your Committee, to whom was
referred the matter of appropria-
t.on for the Community House, re-
DQI‘tT- it has consulted with the
City Attorney and the officials of
the Community House and makes
the following recommendation:

1. That there be transferred
from the budget of the contingent
fund to that of the poor fund, the
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sum of $250.00 and that the Poor
Committee be authorized to expend
this fund before July 1, 1922, in
such way as they shall see fit in
conjunction with the work of the
Poor Comm: ttee.

Alfred H. White,
A. D. Groves.

Ald. White moved the adoption
of report, which was adopted bhy
fol'owing vote: Yeas—Ald. Siau-
son, Sugden, Ehnis Haarer, Lurcas,
Henderson, Donnelly, Grove~, Spa-
thelf, Moore, MacGregor, White,
Norris—13, Nays—none.

Officers’ Reports

Tr-asurer’s Report. City Funds,
FUNDS—CONTINGENT:
Receipts—
Penalty on taxes, $1,-

538.90: excess of rolls,

$363 67; int. $657.41;

garbage c ontract
$230.00; fees $300.85;
s.ale, $42.60; peddlers’
license, $153.00; pool
tables $14.00; dog
$7.50; dray, $1.50;
milk, $1.00; plumber,

1.00; recond hand cars,

$1.00
Cemetery—. .
Sale of lot,

E. E. Lucas,

$30.00; care

lots $3.00; burials $49.00

$49.000 . .............
Police—City fee
Poor—Rent . ...........
Street—Repair pave-

ments, $586.20; sale of

old iron, §7.05; cut-

ting weeds $19.35......
Sidewalk Building— —
Taxes ret. to County Treas. 3293
Water Works General Fund—
Transfer, $13.689.25: re-

ceived $10,2568.99..... 23,948.25
Water Dept. Sinking fund—
Recd. from Mgr. of Dept. 1,500.00
Uncollc cted City Tax—
Taxes returned to Coun-

ty Treas., $6470.74;

taxes collected, $658.31 7,129.05

§2.00
82.00
22.75

5.00

612.60

.............. $36,696.01
65,269.26

Totals
On hand March 1, 1922.

$101,965.27

Warrants paid ........ 77.853.75

On hand April 1, 1922..$24,111.562
Disbursements

Contingent .:swsevmenwsa $6,347.65
Cemetery .........c.... 97.00
Fire De¢partment ....... 3,036.29
Police .....vivvnerosa 2,004.30
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POOr 5 e s @5 @55 5 s s s 283.28
SEPEEL wosmusms ms e s e oown 916.19
PHYEE  : 5 o mew sy o0 s o ¢ owe mwa o o 433.11
Street light ............ 1,860.56
Br.dge, culvert and cross-

walks ... 76.38
Water ‘Works general

17,1 ¢ ¥'; MU 13,689.40
Special Water Works

(completion) ; 1,689.26
Water Dept. sinkng

514 1o IR e 12,000.00
Water—(Hydrant, rental,

€10 wimsmases e vwmenes e 2,376.63
Uncollccted city tax..... 13,110.15
De¢linquent tax .......... 19,933.55

Totalg wiwsmsmssmwswss $77.853.75
On Hand—
Contingent .....ccc00.. $21,081.18
CEHAEIETN sasmesmniwemen 1,211.64
Fire Dept. .. ... ...cva.. 3,038.3
POLICE: o w50 wig s e s 6,5652.61
ParK  weamw s e s s oe aoe e on o 5,471.65
Street light ........... 2,666.35
Sidewalk building ..... 311.02
Bridge, culvert and

crosswalks ........... 5,926.92
Water Works general

fund ....... i 6,724.82
Special Water Works

(completion) ........ 10,506.02
Water Dept. sinking

fund ......... . 000 16,500.00
Water— (Hydrant, rental,

i) sunsesmmimimams e 1,371.24

Totals ....coccwsesss $81,361.79
Overdrawn—
POOY saimsmemps wsmsss $ 320.20
Street (.issnwsvame e wae 12,170.67
Uncoilected ecity tax.... 10,454.04
Delmquent tax ........ 34,305.36

Totals . ...oovevnnnn. $57 250.27
Warrants QOutstanding —
Contingent .............. $ 44.52
Poor ....... .. 2.99
Street ... e 42.25
Park .... . 18.00
Bridge, culvert and cross-

WAlkS svcsimimsmswssmsws 2.256
Water Works general fund. 11.17

Gn hand April 1, 1922....%121.18
Month ending March, 21,1922.
State—County—School,

State—Receipts:
Taxes collected $246.91;
transfer from uncol-
lected city tax fund..$ 4,998.56
County—Receipts:
School—Receipts:
Taxes collected, $5,803.72;
transfer., from uncol.
lected ecity tax fund,
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$2,661.74 . .......... 5305.12
Schooi—Rece.pts:
Taxes collected $5,803.72
ret. to county taxes,
$12.427 38; transfer.
from uncollected city
tax fund, $5,967.19... 24,198.29
$34,501.97
On hand March 1, 1922 287 188.84
$321,690.81
Disbursc ments—
Btate .owswswimssmemes $103,502 82
County’ . .owswsesmnsse $ 93,5636.88
School +.vssmwswenesisn $124,651.11

$321,690.81
SEWER FUNDS—Labor:

On Hand—
Dist. NO: 89 ¢ :wwsnwe s $ 177.60
Dist, No:w 91 ws somanws cm s 80.97
Dist. No. 9206 wswmsmws s in 98.92
Dist, No. 94............ 2,108.33
Dist. No. 95............ 922.32
Dist. No. 96............ 82410
Disk, Now 9T o s ves s v s 1,239.54
Dist. No. 98 ............ 133.18
Dist, No. 99............. 120.17
D' st. No. 100............ 75.86
Dist, No. 101........... 531.56
Dist, No. 102 .......... 943 48
Dist, No. 103............ 366.85
D'st. No, 104............ 425.29
Dist. No. 105............ 20 82
Dist. No. 106 .......... 29.79
Overdrawn—
Dist, No, 90............ $ 302.82
Dist. No., 93. . aiwis 293.15
Dist. No. 107 :scswsnssmas 1,399.70
Dist. No, 108........... 986.28
Dist. No: 109 woses e 705 69
Receipts—
Dist No. 82—Taxes re-

turned to County Treas.$ 31.14
Dist. No 88—Taxcs re-

turned to County Treas. 47.91
Dist. No. 90—Taxes re-

turned to County Treas 65.66
Dist. No. 96—Taxes col-

leeted ..o.nssmsmssmas 14.79
Dist. No. 98—Taxes col-

lected ....covesncsmss 90.217
D'st, No. 101 ........... 528.57
Dist. No. 102—Taxes col-

lected . vveeieeneaae s 274 27

Totals . .vvvvveennunns $1,052.61
On hand March 1, 1922.. 3.358.77

On hand April 1, 1922...$4 611.38
On Hand—

Tigt,. Mo, 70, c.omsmanmus $ 23.14
DiiEt, MO. T3isessinsemes 87.48
Dist No. Tdizisssnvsnns 35.87
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Dist.
Dist.,
D’st.
Dist
Dist.
Dust,
D st,
Dist
Dist.
Dist,
D’st.
Dist,
Dist.
Dist.
Dist.
Dist,
Dist
Dist.

Totals
On hand March 1, 1.22

On hand April 1,1222....%4,611.38

Overdrawn—
Dist. No 72............ $1.704.09
Dst No. 82............. 909.37
Dist,. WO, BOuveaanssznins 96.67
Dist, NO, 87... .. 97.56
Dist. No. 88............ 417.02
Dist. N, 89:vsswvsneaeamsn 110.84
Digt, No 925 o vmwswanws s 127.82
Dist., No. 96............. 79.21
Totals s smawoanmswsaes s $7,230.32
Rece pts—
D st. No. 16—Taxes re-

turned . $15.70; taxes

collectcd, $13.29.... .. $ 28.99
Dist. No. 18—Taxes re

turned ............... 24.28
Dist. No., 21—Taxes re-

turned ........... . ... 9.20
Dist No 24—Taxes re-
turned ................. 8.92
Dist . No. 25—Taxes re-

turned .............. 32.59
Dist. No. 27—Taxes re-

turned .........0.0.... 18.14
Dist, No. 28—Taxes re-

turned ........... ... 39.56
Dit. No. 29—Tax¢<s re-

turned, $70.88; taxes

collected, $63.04 ..... 133.92
Dist. No. 34—Taxes re-

turned .............. 73.86
Dist. No. 36—Taxes re-

turned ............... 55.01
Dist. No. 39—Taxes re-

tIPNed wiswiamaigim s 74.02
Dist. No. 40—Taxes re-

turmed . .o s emm w50 2w s 141.11
Dist. No. 41—Taxes re-

turned ............... 7.12
Dist. No. 43—Taxes col-

lected ............... 72 31

No.

No.

No.
No.

No.

No.
No.

No

No.

No.

No.

No.
No.
No.

No.
No.

No.

No.

..
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T 5w s v 5 5 5 ) 4 o 328.81
T6 swsmaswemsws 210.30
T8 swefeumuomenes 9.18

79. s 58.33
80. v mimmamomn 42 .46

81.......00. 41.77

83. ... 390.31
B4 sisaimanmims 278.00

8D mimanmims 193.91
90:vnmimimasvims 34.00

91 i vsmsmeme s 104 5)
98w wames s 139.40
L L 126.06
98 & v v w6 v @ s 327.26

Mo imsmanmins 418.956

98 s cs s maimymms 90.27
L0Low o wpo i s o 5 mpn s b28.57

102 cvis w6 0 vn s 274.27
.............. $11,841.70

72,230.32
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D'st. No. 44—Taxes re-

turned ........c.c00.... 108.72
Dist. No. 46—Taxes col-

lected ............... 80.40
Dist. No. 47—Taxes col-

lected . .....cc0uiun.. 217.28

MOLAlE .. wimebhismsms $1.196.43

Overdrawn March 1. 1922 3,039.66

$1,43 23

Warrants paid ......... 1,560.00

Overdrawn April 1, 1922.%$3,403.23
Disbusements—

Dist, No. 28............ $1,560.00
Totals ......cuvuvu... $1,560.00
On Hand—
Dist. Ne, 44 ... ... ...... $8,045.30
Dist. No. 13 .......c.c.. 10.20
Dist, No. 14 ............ 16097
Dist: No- 15 wisswmsmcaas 930.75
DISt. NO:. 22 ssmimasminis 338 78
D.ost. No. 23 «.:icsowanss 1 083.44
Dist. NO. 320 wsasiosn 45 08§
Dist:. NO: 83:swswnswmwsnss 160 54
D8t No. 34 iwiveswanmea 651.41
Dist: No, 36 :invewemonmsm 1,216.18
Dist, No. 37 ......c.c.... 111.96
Dist, No. 38 ............ 1,662.81
Dist, No. 40............ 93.27
Dist. No. 41 ............ 307.78
Dist, No. 45 ............ 780.25
Dist, No, 46 ............ 80.40
Dist., No. 47............ 217.28
Totals cimsvisssmeman $16,444.20
Overdrawn—
Digt. No, 43.cimesmsnsos $ 250.00
Dist, No, 16.....-c.cc... 312.79
Dist. NG: 1T swswwsnswss 106.63
Diste: No: 18 swemssmams s 961.54
DEst: No: 19ca:0cmusmens 360.79
Dist, No 20 ............. 1,108.01
Dist. No. 21 ............ 961.56
Dst, No, 24 ............ 77.08
Dist. No. 25 ............ 392.84
Dist. No. 26 ............ 204.15
Dist. No. 27 ............ 1.860.29
Dist. No. 28 ............ 1,508.12
Dist, No. 29 ........... 1,187.82
Drist. NO: 30 swimsomenmzws 819.48
Dist. No. 356 ......c..c.. 155.26
Dist. NO. 39 .nisvmwsmsas 1,405.48
Dist No: 42 wiwswswms s 989.36
Dist, N0, 43 .wviwswviwses 1,407.26
Disti No. 44 v wswiemews 5.778.97
Totals - vevivnnnn. $19,847.43

Overdrawn March 1, 1922 16,444.20

$ 3,403.23
CURB AND GUTTER FUNDS—
Recepits—
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Dict. No. 1—Taxes re-

turned to County Treas § 67.16
Dist. No. 2—Taxes ret.

$11.71, taxes co'lected,

$1B.58  uvesmsmagme s e 28.29
Dist. No., 3—Taxes ret.

to County Treas, ...... 11.52

Taxes collected ....... 335.65
D:st. No., T7—Taxes col-

lected ...t iienenan- 251.656
Dist. No. 8—Taxes rect.

to County Treas. ..... 17.29
Dist. No. 10 bonds sold,

$936.73; taxes collected,

$45.96 ... ... .0 92.69
Dist, No. 11—Bonds sold,

$1.025.45; taxes collect-

od, 321236 cswcimsnins 1.237:81
Dist, No. 12—Taxes col-

lected  oauws s omes e 160.34
Dist. No. 13—Bonds sold 227.96
Dist. No., 14—Taxes col-

le@led . s vvwewss g wwon s m s 52.20
Dist. No. 15—Bonds $1.-

458.0; interest, $24.76;

transfer, $620.55; taxes,

$212.35 ... .. 2,315.72
Dist No. 16—Bonds $1,

591.90; taxes collected,

$114.10 ... ... 1,706.00
D:st, No. 17 —Bonds sold 385.56
Dist, No. 18—Tax:s col-

lected ............... 40 00
Dist, No. 19—Taxes col-

lected ............... 283.317
D'st, No. 20—PRonds sold,

$1,532.22: taxes collect-

ed, $36.22 ............ 1,568.44
Dist, No., 21—Taxes col-

lEeted swocn:mssenesms 13 47
D:st. No. 22—Bonds sold,

$2,425.47; taxes collect-

ed. $2832.08 wiwvasn i s 2,657.55
Dist., No. 23—Bonds sold 313.26

Totals :vemeoscwsnas $12,395.93
Overdrawn March 1, 1922 6,783.92

$ 5,612.01

Warrants paid ........ 675.97
On hand ............. $ 4.936.00
Disbursements—
Dist. No. 7 .........u.... $ 55.42
Dist. No. 22 ............. 620.55

TOotRlS cucmes e m o5 meme $675.97
On Hand—
Dist. No. 2 ............. $ 262.79
Dist, No. 3 ............. 372.38
Dist, No. 4 ............. 25.30
DHSt, NO. D cisime.msss o 208.98
Ingt. NO: 8 :ciweinssmsng 302.44
Dist. Wo, 8 ccvsmesevmsws 276.42
Dist, Wo. 9 winwinswesas s 247.13
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st Mo, 10 .0 aaiars 186.13
IMBL. WO L1 .. r st o 427.90
DISE, NO. 13 5,0 s e ¥ 426.47
DIist. WNo. I3 . .vreriwyy ol 95.07
Dist. No. 14 ............ 89.18
INSt: NG, 18 .osaivso s vn i 463.72
DSt MO 16 oiisms o 421.59
ISt WO 17 wswnami v s 182.22
ISt MNow 18 csmismsniont 74.99
DEst, No: 19 cssisms s nn 150.75
Dist No.- 20 wouamssesns s 209.18
INSE:. o 21 ohsasms s, 99.56
Dist. No, 22 cissnuswzsis 568.57
DSt No. 28 s sov s s wps s 5 48.42
Totals ............... $5,139.19
Overdrawn March 1, 1922 203.15
4,936 04

Overdrawn— #
Dist. NO. 1 ovvurinnnnnnn, $ 12.41
Dist. No. 7 ... ... 190.74
Totals .. ............... $203.1,

Farmers & M («hanies’ Bank,

Ann Arbor, M ch,, April 1, 1922.

Th's ie to certify that Ross Gran-
ger, Treacurer of the City of Ann
Arbor, had on deposit in this bank
at the close of business March

‘31st, 1922, the sum of twenty-eight

thousand, seven hundred thirty-s.x
and scventy-three onc hundredths
dollars ($28.736.73).

FRED P. STOWES, Cashier.

RECAPITULATION.
City funds .on hand..... $24,111.52
Sewer fund¢ on hand... 4611.38
Curb and gutter funds on

hanad 4,936.04

...............

$33,658.94
funds over-
.............. $ 3.403.23
On hand April 1, 1922..$30,255.71
F. & M. Bank balance..$28.736.73
Checks and cash in vault 1,518 98
On hand Apr’l 1, 1922..$30,255.71
ROSS GRANGER,
City Treasurer.

Reports of City Treasurer, Clerk
and Acting Marshal for month of
March received and ordered to take
usual course.

City Attorney Bonisteel made
oral report that he attended hear-
ing on telephone rates before Pub-
lic Utllities Commission and gave
detailed report of rates proposed
for various cities and that a day
would be set for City of Ann Arbor
to be heard. :

City Clerk reported that Wash-

Pavement
darawn
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tenaw Gag Co. had presented a
copy of audit for the year 1921, and
same was ordered on file.

By Ald. Moore:

Resolved, that the Common
Council resolve itself into a Board
of Election Canvassers, and canvass
the vote on the elections held in
this city April 3, 1322,

Adopted by unanimous vote of
those present—13,

Report of Election
Ann Arbor, Michi
' April 6, 1922
To the Board of Election Canvas-
sers of the City of Ann Arbor,
Michigan.
Gentlemen:

The following is a tabulation of
the votes received by the several
candidates for ward offices and the
number of votes cast for and
against the several city propositions
voted on at the elections held in
this city Monday, April 3, 1922:

Supervisors

1st ward-—Laverne O. Cushing,
156. No onposition.

2nd ward—William A. Dupslaff,
192; Gustave H. Nowak, 162, Dups-
laff’s majority, 30.

3rd ward—Louls B. Howard, 189.
No opposition.

4th ward—C. Walter Tubbs 149;
Jay C. Herrick, 306. Herrick’s
majority, 157. ,

5th ward—Roger I. Manwar.ng,
120. No opposition.

6th ward—Christopher €. Par-
nall, 171; H. L. Wilgus, 1; George

Blaich, 1. Parnall’s plurality, 169.

7th ward—Frank E. Royce, 1st
precinct, 111; 2nd precinet, 219;
total 330. Gustave M. Meyer 1st

precinct, 83; 2nd precinct, 33; total
116. Royce’'s majority, 214,
Aldemen

1st ward—Willis G. Johnson, 150.
No opposition.

Znd ward—Clyde Tessmer, 159;
Benjamin H. Graf, 193. Graf’s ma-
jority, 34,

3rd ward—E. Edward Lucas, 201,
No opposition.

4th ward—Charles E. Gallup,

226; Jerome W. Markey, 230. Mar-
key’s majority, 4.
5th ward—Rembert Jones, 75;

George Spathelf, 80. Spathelf’s ma-
Jjority, 5.
6th ward—Charles C. Freeman,
167; John MacGregor, 9.
Moon, 1. Freeman’s plurality, 157.
ith ward—Robert Norris, 1st

E. L.

297..

precinct, 105; 2nd precinet, 217;
total 322. Martin J. Schaller, 1st
precinct, 90; 2nd precinct, 35; total
125. Norris’ majority, 197.
Constables

1st ward—Ernest H. White 123;
Charles M. King, 48. White's ma-
jority, 75.

2nd ward—Jacob Hartman, 238.
No opposition.

3rd ward—Harry
194. No opposition.

E. Saunders,

4th ward—George W. Gough,
255. No opposition.

5th ward—Roy D. Court, 106;
William F. Enkemann, 48. Court’s
majority, 58.

6th ward—C. Smith, 3. No op-
position.

7th ward—Myron H. Mills 1st
precinet, 121; 2nd precinct, 207;
total 328. Charles M. Brown. 1st

precinet, 73: 2nd precinct, 43; total
116. Mills’ majority, 212.
Propositions
Amendment to Section 88 o® th~

charter by adding Parazraph
Thirty-seventh, thereto:
Yes No
Ist ward ............ 111 57
2nd ward ............ 158 185
3rd ward ............ 93 126
4th ward ............ 240 168
5th ward ............ 83 64
6th ward ............ 149 39
Tth ward 1st prect.. ... 114 151
Tth ward 24 prect.... 201 49
Totals ............ 1,149 773
Majority for ....... 376

For the purchase and installation
of an automatic electric fire alarm
system:

Yes No

Ist ward .........0.- 80 92
2nd ward ............ 117 233
3rd ward ............ 56 164
4th ward ............ 156 243
5th ward ............ 45 106
6th ward ............ 96 99
7th ward 1st prect..... 57 141
7th ward 2d prect..... 112 139
Totals ............ 719 1,217
Majority against ... 498

Respectfully submitted
ISAAC G. REYNOLDS,
City Clerk.

By Ald. Moore:

Resolved, that the Board of Elec-
tion Canvassers accept and adopt
the report of the City Clerk, and
adjourn and resume in session of
Common Council.
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Adopted by following vote: Yeas
—Ald. Slauson, Sugden, Ehnis,
Haarer, Lucas, Henderson, Donnel-
ly, Groves, Spathe'f Moore, Mac-

Gregor, White, Norris—13. Nays—
none.
Re~olved, that the Common

Council of the City of Ann Arbor
at a regular session of the Common
Council held at the Council Cham-
her in said city on the 6th day of
April, 1922, found the following
named persons duly elected to the
offices named herein:

Supervisors—1st ward, Laverne
O. Cushing; 2nd ward, William A.
Dupslaff; 3rd ward, Louis B, How-
ard; 4th ward, Jay C. Herrick; 5th
ward, Roger 1. Manwaring; 6th
ward, Christopher G. Parnall; Tth
ward, Frank E. Royce.

Aldermen—1st ward, Willis G.
Johnson; 2nd ward. Benjamin H.
Graf; 3rd ward, E. Edward Lucas;
4th ward, Jerome W. Markey; 5th
ward, George Spathe’'f; 6th ward,
Charles C. Freeman; 7th ward,
Robert Norris.

Constables—1st ward, Ernest H.
White; 2nd ward, Jacob Hartman;
ord ward, Harry E. Saunders; 4th
ward, George W. Gough; 5th ward,
Roy D. Court; 6th ward, C. Smith;
7th ward, Myron H. Mills.

Resolved, further, that the prop-
osition to amend Section 88 of the
Charter Dby adding Paragraph
Thirty-seventh thereto, was ap-
proved by the nece-sary number
of votes of the electors voting
‘thereon.

Resolved, further that the prop-
osition for the purchase and in-
stallation of an automatic fire
alarm system lost by a majority of
four hundred and ninety-eight
against said proposition of the
votes cast at said election.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas
—Ald. Slaucon, Sugden, FEhnis,
Haarer, Lucas, Henderson, Donnel-
ly, Groves, Spathelf, Moore, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norris—13. Nays—
none.

By Ald. Slauson:

Whereas. the Common Council
has authorized the construction by
the Board of Public Works of a
pavement known as pavement on
“alley in B. 2 N., R. 3 E., known as
pavement District No. 46, and the
Common Council having caused to
be certified to the City Assessor the
landrs, tenements and premises to

COMMON COUNCIL—APRIL 3,

1922.

be assessed for cost of said public
improvement;

Resolved, and it is hereby or-
dered, that the Mayor and the City
Clerk are hereby authorized and
required to execute, under their
hands and the seal of the City of
Ann. Arbor, pavement bonds of the
City of Ann .Arbor, under date of
April 1, 1922, for $992.57, that he-
‘ng the cost of such improvement,
payable to bearer in ten equal in-
stallments from and after the 1st
day of August, 1922, at the office
of the City Treasurer, with inter-
et at 5 percent per annum, pay-
ab’e annually on the 1st day of
August in each and every year,
principal to be payable at the op-
tion of the City Treasurer pursuant
to law.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas
—Ald. Slauson  Sugden, Ehnis,
Haarer, Lucas, Henderson, Donnel-
ly, Groves, Spathelf Mpoore, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norris—13. Nays—
none.

By Ald. Slauson:

Whereas, the Common Council
has authorized the cons‘ruction by
the Board of Public Works of a
pavement Known as pavement on
alley in B. 3 N., R. 4 E., known as
Pavement Di-triect No. 47, and the
Common Council having caused t?
be certified to the City Asses?or
the lands, tenements and premises
to be assessed for cosls of said
pub'ic improvement;

Resolved, and it is hereby or-
dered that the Mayor and the City
Clerk are hereby authorized and re-
quired to execute, under iheir hand:
and the seal of the City of Ann
Arbor, pavement bonds of the City
of Ann Arbor, under date of April
1, 1922, for $1,769.85, that being
the cost of such improvement pay-
able to bearer in ten equal annual
installments, from and after the 1st
day of August, 1922, at the office
of the City Treasurer, with inter-
est at 5 percent per annum, pay-
able annually on the ist day of
August in each- and every. year,
principal to be payable at the op-
tion of the City Treasurer pursuant
to law.

Adopted by folow ng vote: Yeas
—Ald. Slauson. Sugden, Ehnis
Haarer, Tiucas, Hender-ion, .Donnel-
'y, Groves. Spathelf, Moore, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norris—1.3 Nays—
none.
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Moved by Ald. Donnelly, that
Alderman Mark B. Sugden bhe
authorized to appoint the standing
committees of this Council for the
ensuing year and that he be elected
President pro tem. of the Common
Council for the unexpired term of

former President Reichert, re-
s.gned.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas
—Ald. Slauson, Sugden, Ehnis

Haarer, Lucas, Henderson, Donnel-
ly, Groves, Spathelf Moore, Mac-
Gregor, White, Norris—13. Nays—
none,

Chair appointed City Attorney

1922

Bonisteel, Ald. Norris and Ald.
White as a special committee to
prepare proper resolutions re'ative
to retiring President R. E. Reich-
ert.

The retiring Aldermen, Herbert
M. Slauson, Herman G. Ehnis,
Christopher T. Donnelly and John
MacGregor expressed the thought
that they were leaving with happy
recollections of their associations
and with a valuable experience.

On motion of Ald. Donnelly,
Council adjourned.

ISAAC G. REYNOLDS,
City Clerk.
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